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Cc: ekos92166@gmail.com, Ulfa Amalia <ulfaamalia.psi@uty.ac.id>, ulfa amalia <ulfaamalia@gmail.com>

Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)


With all our respect, herewith we enclose the edited manuscript entitled: "The Utilization of Flashcard to Enhance
Students’ Writing Performance: An Action Research" and payment proof for the article's publication in the Indonesian
Research Journal in Education (IRJE). We highly appreciate the great work you and your team have done to ensure the
manuscript quality. Again, we will always be available if you still have any other concerns for the betterment of the
manuscript.


Sincerely yours,

Authors 
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Cc: ekos92166@gmail.com, Ulfa Amalia <ulfaamalia.psi@uty.ac.id>, ulfa amalia <ulfaamalia@gmail.com>

Dear Author (s),

Thank very much for your email and the documents. Our editorial team will send you the LoA and your paper will be
copyedited this week, published ASAP.


Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id
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Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)


Thank you very much Professor for the valuable information.  

Best regards,
Authors
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Dear Author (s),
Your paper is being copyedited. It will be online soon.


Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id
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Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin
Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)
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Best regards,
Authors
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Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> Sun, Jun 12, 2022 at 8:39 AM
To: Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id>

Dear Author (s),
 
In reference to your manuscript entitled: " The
Utilization of Flashcard
to Enhance Students’ Writing Performance: An Action
Research". Our decision is: ACCEPTED. Please find enclosed
draft and
revised as suggested. Please send the payment of IDR 2.000,000 to the BANK account:
1100007869842-
Mandiri Bank and the account holder: Dery Mulya Putri. Please
email the proof of subscription fee to this email.

Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id


On Thu, Jun 9, 2022 at 4:25 AM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)



The following is attached our revised manuscript based on reviewers' feedback and advice. We would be more than
happy to revise it again if you have any other concerns for the betterment of the manuscript.


Respectfully
Authors 


On Wed, Jun 8, 2022 at 2:35 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Yes Prof. I will send it soon. 


On Wed, Jun 8, 2022, 13:11 Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:




Dear Author (s),


Please send the revised one before Sunday this week.





Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id





On Wed, Jun 8, 2022 at 9:09 AM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin


Thank you in advance for considering our manuscript to be published in Indonesian Research Journal of
Education in June 2022. We are now working for the manuscript revision. Hopefully, we could finish revision no
more than a week. Again, thank you for every single step you have done for the betterment of the manuscript.
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Best regards,


Authors


On Tue, Jun 7, 2022, 23:06 Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:




Dear Author (s),


Please find the attachment and revise as suggested. Please send the revised one ASAP for the inclusion of
the JUNE 2022 issue if your revision meets our standards.





Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id





On Sun, Mar 20, 2022 at 5:11 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Noted with thanks. 


On Sun, Mar 20, 2022, 16:07 Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:




Dear Author (s),


You add more authors. later if your paper is accepted.  





Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id





On Sun, Mar 20, 2022 at 3:43 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin,

Yes, Prof. It would be fine. However, would it be possible to add another author in the submitted
manuscript? 

Regards,
Authors

On Sun, Mar 20, 2022, 13:32 Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:



Dear Authors,
 
Thank you for your interest in our journal. For
your information, starting from Volume 5, Issue 2, December 2021,
IRJE starts
charging every accepted  manuscript for proofreading, editing, and
formatting. However, IRJE does not
charge for publication. Proofreading,
editing, and formatting are the most challenging parts as IRJE does not have
any full time staff. Authors frequently do not follow the  template and
use “GOOGLE TRANSLATE” and IRJE is
very strict with in-text- citation and
references and IRJE will directly REJECT the paper that does not follow the
APA
style.
 
For example, for References:
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Hamann, D., Lineburgh, N., & Paul, S. (1998).
Teaching Effectiveness and Social Skill Development. Journal of
Research in
Music Education. (There is no Volume, Number, and pages)
Funmilayo, A. (2019). Achievement: Frameworks
for assessing music teaching, 1–21. (No Journal name, no volume and
number)
Danielsons, C. (2009). Framework for teaching.
(No Publisher)
 
For those reasons, IRJE charges every
accepted  manuscript for proofreading, editing, and formatting. The amount
is between RP.2.000.000-RP.2.500.000 and it depends on the conditions of the
paper.
 
Publishing in IRJE is free of charge. However,
we have found that more and more papers have ignored the
standard of
writing including the references, citations, writing mechanism, and
formatting that make
editors spend more time to deal with those issues
which influence the quality of our journal. Since our
journal is not
funded, we will charge authors if they cannot revise the issues.


Please let us know if your paper is accepted, you
are fully aware of the charge and we may go with the process of
review.
However, the reviewer process will be very strict.
 
Thank you very much for your understanding.


Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id
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Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> Sun, Jun 12, 2022 at 9:19 AM
To: Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id>

Dear Editor(s)

Thank you in advance for accepting our manuscript to be published in the Indonesian Research Journal of Education in
June 2022. We are more than happy to re-revise the manuscript as suggested and pay the fee accordingly ASAP. We
highly appreciate if we could have LoA for the manuscript. Again, thank you very much.

Best regards, 

Authors
[Quoted text hidden]

Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> Sun, Jun 12, 2022 at 12:19 PM
To: Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id>

Dear Author (s),

Please send the revised one and the payment proof, so the editorial board will process accordingly and send you the
LoA.


Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
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Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> Sun, Jun 12, 2022 at 1:25 PM
To: Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id>

Yes Prof. Thanks in advance for the information. We will notify you soon for the revision and payment. 

Respectfully,
Authors
[Quoted text hidden]
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To: Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id>
Cc: ekos92166@gmail.com, Ulfa Amalia <ulfaamalia.psi@uty.ac.id>, ulfa amalia <ulfaamalia@gmail.com>

Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)


With all our respect, herewith we enclose the edited manuscript entitled: "The Utilization of Flashcard to Enhance
Students’ Writing Performance: An Action Research" and payment proof for the article's publication in the Indonesian
Research Journal in Education (IRJE). We highly appreciate the great work you and your team have done to ensure the
manuscript quality. Again, we will always be available if you still have any other concerns for the betterment of the
manuscript.


Sincerely yours,

Authors 
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Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> Fri, Jun 24, 2022 at 4:05 PM
To: Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id>

Dear Author (s),

Please look at the link: https://online-journal.unja.ac.id/irje/article/view/17528
Congratulations.


Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id


On Sun, Jun 19, 2022 at 7:43 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin
Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)


Thank you very much for the valuable information.  


Best regards,
Authors


On Sun, Jun 19, 2022, 19:12 Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:




Dear Author (s),
Your paper is being copyedited. It will be online soon.





Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id





On Mon, Jun 13, 2022 at 4:34 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)



Thank you very much Professor for the valuable information.  


Best regards,
Authors


On Mon, Jun 13, 2022 at 3:30 PM Indonesian Research Journal in Education <irje@unja.ac.id> wrote:




Dear Author (s),
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Thank very much for your email and the documents. Our editorial team will send you the LoA and your paper will
be copyedited this week, published ASAP.





Editor

Indonesian Research Journal in Education 

The Graduate School, Doctoral Program in Education
Jambi University

Jl. Raden Mattaher No.16, Jambi

Indonesia 36113
E-mail: irje@unja.ac.id





On Mon, Jun 13, 2022 at 2:37 PM Juhansar Andi Latief <juhansar@uty.ac.id> wrote:


Dear Professor Amirul Mukminin

Lead Editor of Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE)



With all our respect, herewith we enclose the edited manuscript entitled: "The Utilization of Flashcard to
Enhance Students’ Writing Performance: An Action Research" and payment proof for the article's publication
in the Indonesian Research Journal in Education (IRJE). We highly appreciate the great work you and your
team have done to ensure the manuscript quality. Again, we will always be available if you still have any other
concerns for the betterment of the manuscript.



Sincerely yours,

Authors 
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